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I would like to extend my sincere apologies for the delay in responding to your previous email containing the invoice for the APC fee. I
acknowledge that this delay may have caused inconvenience, and I appreciate the patience and understanding of the journal's team.

I would like to confirm that I have received the invoice you sent and am in the process of completing the payment for the APC fee. I hope to
finalize this process as soon as possible and will send proof of payment to you once it is done.

Additionally, could you provide further information on the next steps after the APC payment is completed? For instance, are there any
additional steps I need to take or documents I need to submit to complete the publication process for my article?

Thank you very much for your attention and assistance in this process. I truly appreciate the opportunity to contribute to your journal and look
forward to seeing my article published soon.

Best regards,
( Author )
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com> 12 April 2024 pukul 22.37
Kepada: Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

we will publish your paper soon
Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 于2024年4月9日周二 07:38写道：
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 18 April 2024 pukul 20.35
Kepada: Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>

Subject: Inquiry regarding payment of publication fees and publication schedule

Dear Editor,

I hope this email finds you well. I am writing to inquire about the publication schedule of my paper

entitled "Transformation in the development of micro, small, and medium enterprises in utilizing

digital marketing technology competencies in Makassar City, South Sulawesi, Indonesia," which I

submitted to the Journal of Logistics, Informatics, and Service Science.

Additionally, I would like to proceed with the payment of the publication fee of USD$715. Could

you please provide me with full bank account details, including the account number, account

holder's name, bank name, branch address, and any other information required for the transfer?

Your prompt response to this inquiry will be greatly appreciated.

Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Sincerely,

Author

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com> 18 April 2024 pukul 21.04
Kepada: Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

all information is in the invoice

Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 于2024年4月18日周四 09:35写道：
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

Fwd: Vol.11.No.6.14
1 pesan

Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com> 26 Mei 2024 pukul 09.09
Kepada: "anzharihasnud@gmail.com" <anzharihasnud@gmail.com>, Hasanuddin Remmang
<remmanghasan@gmail.com>, haarnashasanuddin@gmail.com

please format your paper
you cannot number the references, all references must be sorted by authors' last name as A-Z
citations must be consistent
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Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

(tanpa subjek)
2 pesan

Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 27 Mei 2024 pukul 20.39
Kepada: Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>

Dear ,Mincong

Thank you for your feedback on my paper.

I have made the necessary corrections. The references have been formatted according to your
guidelines: they are now sorted by the authors' last names in alphabetical order (A-Z).
Additionally, all citations within the text have been adjusted to ensure consistency.

Please find the revised version of my paper attached.

Thank you for your assistance.

Best regards,

[ Hasanuddin Remmang ]
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336K

Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com> 28 Mei 2024 pukul 07.59
Kepada: Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

you have to format your paper 

Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 于2024年5月27日周一 09:39写道：
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

Fwd: Fwd: Revised Article Submission Following Format and Template Guidelines
2 pesan

Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com> 4 Juni 2024 pukul 08.34
Kepada: Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>

We cannot consider your paper as
1. table 2 and table 4 are figures, we need tables, editable. In addition, they are the same.
2. all references are not consistent with the journal, please check.
3. you have to ask native speaker to polish the language. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
发件人： Xianwei Luo <lxwyy@sina.com>
Date: 2024年6月3日周一 20:05
Subject: Re: Fwd: Revised Article Submission Following Format and Template Guidelines
To: mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>

丢死，这篇真是laji.乱，我帮他排好，现在要他确认一下有没有问题：

1、表格2和表格4放置的是图片，而且两个是一样的，要更正。
2、参考文献要要按照格式要求逐个确认，断句，格式比较混乱
3、整个文章校对

----- Original Message -----
From: Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>
To: Xianwei Luo <lxwyy@sina.com>
Subject: Fwd: Revised Article Submission Following Format and Template Guidelines
Date: 2024-06-04 03:03

---------- 转发的邮件 ---------
发件人： Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com>
日期：2024年6月3日 周一下午1:52
主题：Revised Article Submission Following Format and Template Guidelines
收件人：Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>

Dear Mincong,
 
I hope this email finds you well.
 
I am writing to inform you that I have revised my article titled "Transformation in The Development of
Small and Medium Micro Enterprises in Utilizing Digital Marketing Technology Competencies in
Makassar City, South Sulawesi, Indonesia" in accordance with the formatting and template guidelines
provided by the journal. The necessary adjustments have been made to ensure full compliance with the
submission requirements.
 
Attached to this email, you will find the updated version of the manuscript. Please let me know if there
are any additional changes or further information required.
 
Thank you for your assistance and consideration.
 
Best regards,
 
Hasanuddin Remmang
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Universitas Bosowa

Vol.11.No.6.14.docx
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Hasanuddin Remmang <remmanghasan@gmail.com> 4 Juni 2024 pukul 15.01
Draf Untuk: Mincong <tang12290@gmail.com>

Ok, I will check. 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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